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BAG O FUN (SAFE &
SANE)

Case Quantity: 24
assortments per case.

A great little safe and sane
assortment of fun for the
kids including snaps, party
poppers, morning glories
and pistol poppers. You
get 24 assortments per
case making making them
a great party favor. Grab a
case for your next party
and the kids will love you!

Product Code: AT113

Our Price: $197.70 

Fireworks Assortments

BROTHERS
CONTAINER LOAD
(20TH
ANNIVERSARY
LABEL)

Case Quantity: 1
assortment containing 30
pieces. 

With Brothers Container
Load, you get the best of
the best! A total fireworks
show in one package from
one of the top selling
brands. The 30 pieces in
this giant assortment
includes: artillery shell kits,
roman candles,
helicopters, ground
spinners, fountains,
firecracke... Read More

Product Code: AT131

Our Price: $601.80 Fireworks Assortments

FLYING SPACE

Case Quantity: 6
assortments per case.

A great bag from Winda
that's full of BOOM! Comes
with firecrackers, saturn
missiles, comets, cakes,
fountains, rockets,
sparklers, roman candles,
and more! 19 different
kinds of fireworks in each
bag.

Buy now and get 6
assortments per case!

Product Code: AT248

Our Price: $305.60 

Fireworks Assortments

FRANKLIN
FIREWORKS
ASSORTMENT

This set is great for adding
a fireworks show to your
backyard BBQ, birthday
party, or any get-together.
Includes 35x 500-gram
cakes, 38x 200-gram
cakes, 6x 350-gram cakes,
and 4 tube racks.

Product Code: AT100

Our Price: $2,267.00 

Fireworks Assortments
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JEFFERSON
FIREWORKS
ASSORTMENT

This package has all the
firepower you need to
leave your neighborhood in
awe. Includes 60x 500-
gram cakes, 18x 350-gram
cakes, 38x 200-gram
cakes, and 6 tube racks.

Product Code: AT101

Our Price: $3,956.30 

Fireworks Assortments

JOHNNY BS PYRO
SET (S&S)

Case Quantity: 8
assortments per case.

A safe and sane version of
one of our best value tray
assortments. This set is
packed with lots of
goodies to keep your
family lighting fuses all
night!

Product Code: AT143

Our Price: $205.90 

Fireworks Assortments

LIL GOODIE BAG
(SAFE & SANE)

Case Quantity: 16
assortments per case.

A great little assortment
for the kids that comes in
a handsome transparent
bag with red handles so
they can easily pick it up
and carry it around.
Includes 2 cone fountains,
6 base fountains, 2 box
fountains, 1 cylindrical
fountain, 4 confetti
poppers, 6 morning glory
sparklers, ... Read More

Product Code: AT251

Our Price: $184.90 

Fireworks Assortments

PYRO PRINCESS
PACK - SAFE AND
SANE

Case Quantity: 12
assortments per case.

Make the girl in your life
feel like a princess with a
pyro pack just for her! The
reusable bag comes
packed with all the
fireworks a girl needs, and
pink piping to make it
pretty. Makes a great party
favor or gift.

Product Code: AT265H

Our Price: $225.80 

Fireworks Assortments
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THE MAX

Case Quantity: 1
assortment per case. 

The Max sized tray from
Brothers! A huge try with
782 total shots 8,000
grams of powder includes
500 gram cakes and
canister shells.

Product Code: AT273

Our Price: $776.50 

Fireworks Assortments

WASHINGTON
FIREWORKS
ASSORTMENT

This is the ultimate, no-
holds barred, surefire set
for putting on the best
fireworks show in the
county! This amazing set
includes 96 500-gram
cakes, 18 350-gram cakes,
38 200-gram cakes, and 8
tube racks.

Product Code: AT102

Our Price: $6,490.40 

Fireworks Assortments

DESPERADO

Case Quantity: 36 shells
per case. 

This kit contains 36 shells
with a total of 108 breaks.
There are double and quad
ball shells, as well as triple
break canister shells.

Product Code: RL190

Our Price: $207.30 

Artillery Shells (Reloadable)

FESTIVAL BALLS -
1.5"

Case Quantity: 6 shells per
box, 15 boxes per case (90
total pieces).

A vintage label decorates
this box of colorful artillery
shells with report.

Product Code: RL104

Our Price: $141.10 

Artillery Shells (Reloadable)
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GAME OF BOOMS -
1.5" BALL SHELLS

Case Quantity: 12 shells
per bag, 12 bags per case
(144 total pieces).

Make the maximum
impact for your pyro dollar
this year with Game of
Booms. Each bag contains
12 shells and a launch
tube.

Product Code: RL214

Our Price: $153.10 

Artillery Shells (Reloadable)

HELLCAT CANS -
1.75" (CANISTERS
4/24)

Case Quantity: 24 shells
per box, 4 boxes per case
(96 shells total). 

These premium artillery
shells from Sky Bacon are
sure to be a blast this year!
Each kit contains 4
durable, fiberglass mortars
and twenty-four 60-gram
shells labeled for effect.

Product Code: RL240A

Our Price: $337.50 

Artillery Shells (Reloadable)

HOME RUN SHELLS -
1.75"

Case Quantity: 6 shells per
box, 12 boxes per case (72
total pieces).

These shells hit hard with
assorted colors and
effects. A retail favorite
from Sky Bacon.

Product Code: RL103

Our Price: $121.80 

Artillery Shells (Reloadable)

MAMMOTH 6-INCH
SHELLS - 1.75" (60
GRAM CANISTER)

Case Quantity: 24 shells
per box, 3 boxes per case
(72 total pieces).

Read More

Product Code: RL134

Our Price: $310.80 

Artillery Shells (Reloadable)
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NISHIKI BOMBS 5-
INCH SHELLS - 1.75"
(60 GRAM
CANISTER)

Case Quantity: 24 shells
per box, 4 boxes per case
(96 total pieces).

The most popular new
shell for 2022! Each 5-inch
shell explodes into a giant
nishiki willow with color,
strobe, or crackling pistils.
LOUD breaks with long-
hanging nishiki kamuro
effects.

Product Code: RL132

Our Price: $343.90 

Artillery Shells (Reloadable)

PLUTONIUM 5-INCH
SHELLS - 1.75" (60
GRAM CANISTER)

Case Quantity: 24 shells
per box, 4 boxes per case
(96 total pieces).

These shells are nuclear!
Each 5" monster artillery
shell deflagrates into an
amazing display with gold,
silver, or red radioactive
remains.

Product Code: RL131

Our Price: $329.00 

Artillery Shells (Reloadable)

PREMIUM FESTIVAL
BALLS 1" -
CANISTERS

Case Quantity: 6 shells per
box, 15 boxes per case (90
total pieces).

A great assortment of
small canister shells with
colors, glitter and flying
fish.

Product Code: RL105A

Our Price: $136.60 

Artillery Shells (Reloadable)

RUBICON

Case Quantity: 88 shells
per case. 

This monster kit contains
88 shells with a total of
160 breaks! One of the
hottest new products from
Brothers, this kit has all the
firepower you need.

Product Code: RL193

Our Price: $365.90 

Artillery Shells (Reloadable)

Page 6Warehouse B Fireworks.us Catalog

https://www.fireworks.us/nishiki-bombs-5-inch-shells-1-75-p/RL132.htm
https://www.fireworks.us/nishiki-bombs-5-inch-shells-1-75-p/RL132.htm
https://www.fireworks.us/plutonium-5-inch-shells-1-75-p/RL131.htm
https://www.fireworks.us/plutonium-5-inch-shells-1-75-p/RL131.htm
https://www.fireworks.us/premium-festival-balls-1-inch-p/RL105A.htm
https://www.fireworks.us/premium-festival-balls-1-inch-p/RL105A.htm
https://www.fireworks.us/rubicon-1-75-asst--breaks-p/RL193.htm
https://www.fireworks.us/rubicon-1-75-asst--breaks-p/RL193.htm


SERIOUS
EQUIPMENT - 1.75"
(ASST. BREAKS)

Case Quantity: 1 box
containing 48 shells. 

When you are ready for a
serious fireworks show,
step it up with Serious
Equipment. This giant kit
contains forty-eight 1.75"
artillery shells and six 14"
tubes. You will get 82
breaks from ball shells,
cylinder shells, peanut
shells and triple-break
shells. Effects: crackling,...
Read More

Product Code: RL118

Our Price: $235.00 

Artillery Shells (Reloadable)

SMOKE-N-MIRRORS
- 1.75" (CANISTERS)

Case Quantity: 6 shells per
pack, 3 packs per box, 4
boxes per case (72 total
pieces). 

The hottest selling artillery
shell in the U.S.! Simply
unbelievable breaks. There
is no illusion with Smoke
and Mirrors. Each box has
three kits of six 60g, max
load, canister shells which
are manufactured using
newly developed techn...
Read More

Product Code: RL151

Our Price: $296.40 

Artillery Shells (Reloadable)

MOON TRAVELERS
WITH REPORT

Case Quantity: 144 bottle
rockets per pack, 25 packs
per case (3600 total
pieces).

A fireworks staple, Sky
Bacon Moon Travelers
offer classic bottle rocket
action. Rockets fly up with
a bang at the end.

Product Code: BR101

Our Price: $193.60 

Bottle Rockets

TRIPLE WHISTLER
ROCKET W/ REPORT

Case Quantity: 144 bottle
rockets per pack. 20 packs
per case (2880 total
pieces).

Each stick flies up with a
three-stage whistle. A neat
effect and a premium
bottle rocket.

Product Code: BR112

Our Price: $240.00 

Bottle Rockets

Page 7Warehouse B Fireworks.us Catalog

https://www.fireworks.us/serious-equipment-1-75-asst--breaks-p/RL118.htm
https://www.fireworks.us/serious-equipment-1-75-asst--breaks-p/RL118.htm
https://www.fireworks.us/smoke-n-mirror-1-75-canisters-p/RL151.htm
https://www.fireworks.us/smoke-n-mirror-1-75-canisters-p/RL151.htm
https://www.fireworks.us/moon-travelers-with-report-p/BR101.htm
https://www.fireworks.us/moon-travelers-with-report-p/BR101.htm
https://www.fireworks.us/triple-whistler-rocket-w-report-p/BR112.htm
https://www.fireworks.us/triple-whistler-rocket-w-report-p/BR112.htm


WHISTLING MOON
TRAVELERS WITH
REPORT

Case Quantity: 144 bottle
rockets per pack, 20 packs
per case (2880 total
pieces).

High-end bottle rockets
that whistle on the way up
and end with a report.

Product Code: BR103

Our Price: $186.20 

Bottle Rockets

100 YELLOW
RIBBONS - 49
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 12 pieces
per case. 

Bigger is better! Kick off
your show with this great
cake. 49 shots of gold, red,
and green comets with lots
of yellow tails and
crackling comet tails. 

Duration: 30 secs.

Product Code: MS142

Our Price: $122.00 

Cakes / Repeaters

4TH OF JULY
PARADE - 20 SHOTS

Case Quantity: 18 pieces
per case.

A patriotic little power-
shot. These 20 shots are
red, white, blue and
amazing.

Product Code: MS247

Our Price: $143.20 

Cakes / Repeaters

99 RED BALLOONS -
16 SHOT

Case Quantity: 12 pieces
per case. 

Silver glittering mines lead
up to red and silver
glittering stars. A simple
yet beautiful effect.

Duration: 30 secs.

Product Code: MS127

Our Price: $137.30 

Cakes / Repeaters
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AMERICAN
WILDCARD - 49
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 12 pieces
per case (49 shots each).

Go all in with American
Wildcard - the sequel to
Wildcard from Brothers!
This beast of a cake
embodies the American
spirit with crackling mines
to red, green, silver and
lemon palms. A new take
on an old classic! The
American way!

Product Code: MS590US

Our Price: $142.20 

Cakes / Repeaters

ANGRY COWBOY -
16 SHOTS

Case Quantity: 16 pieces
per case. 

This cowboy comes out
shooting with brocade tails
to brocade crown and
color stars with crackle.

Duration: 25 sec.

Product Code: MS116

Our Price: $173.20 

Cakes / Repeaters

AWAKENING - 16
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 16 pieces
per case (16 shots
each).Check this out! V-
shape shots of brocade
with white glitter, crackling
and silver fish, brocade
with red glitter, purple and
green glitter, and a finale of
crackling brocade. A real
eye-opener!

Read More

Product Code: MS615

Our Price: $170.00 

Cakes / Repeaters

BACON TREK - 18
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 18 pieces
per case (18 shots each).

Voyage to the unknown
with red and green palms,
white and gold strobe,
crackling mine, and silver
and purple comets.
Phasers fire with a
crackling finale.

Product Code: MS138

Our Price: $192.10 

Cakes / Repeaters
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BLING BLING - 36
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 12 pieces
per case. 

A staff favorite, Bling Bling
is one of the best multi
shots in America. This
cake tricks out the sky with
green bling with purple
stars, then red, blue and
white bling to red and
green bouquets with time
delay bling and crackling
bling. Duration: 38 secs.
New refractive packaging
for ... Read More

Product Code: MS202

Our Price: $151.50 

Cakes / Repeaters

BUMP BEAR - 16
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 24 pieces
per case. 

One of Winda's best
sellers, Bump Bear
features gold, red, silver,
and green palms with
silver glittering tails.

Product Code: MS362

Our Price: $195.40 

Cakes / Repeaters

CALL FROM
OUTERSPACE - 102
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 18 pieces
per case. 

Distant galaxies will be
watching your show when
you fire off this 102 cake.
Crackling mines, red, green
and blue tails with loud
series of reports build up
to a quickened final 30
shots. 

Duration: 45 secs.

Product Code: MS150

Our Price: $129.70 

Cakes / Repeaters

COLOR FISH - 16
SHOT

Case Quantity: 12 pieces
per case. 

A colorful cake with a
unique effect. Sure to
stand out in any fireworks
show.

Product Code: MS420A

Our Price: $144.70 

Cakes / Repeaters
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COLOR PEARL - 48
SHOT

Case Quantity: 80 pieces
per case. 

A classic family-friendly
multi shot. Red and green
pearls shoot rapidly into
the air. 80 pieces per case.

Product Code: MS120

Our Price: $128.90 

Cakes / Repeaters

COLOR PEARL - 96
SHOT

Case Quantity: 40 pieces
per case. 

Twice as nice as a 48-shot
color pearl, this marvel
shoots pretty glowing orbs
into the air, one after
another.

Product Code: MS121

Our Price: $133.10 

Cakes / Repeaters

CUBA LIBRE - 9
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 48 pieces
per case (9 shots each).

Shots of green, blue, and
silver tails with a splash of
blue, purple, gold breaks
with strobe or crackle
centers.

Duration: 12 secs.

Product Code: MS131

Our Price: $165.70 

Cakes / Repeaters

DINO PACK -
ASSORTED

Case Quantity: 6 pieces per
pack, 8 packs per case. 48
pieces total (7 shots each).

This killer 6-pack includes
T-Rex, Velociraptor,
Stegosaurus, Triceratops,
Pterodactyl, and
Megalosaurus.

Product Code: MS110

Our Price: $140.50 

Cakes / Repeaters
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EL PATRON - 15
SHOT

Case Quantity: 8 pieces per
case. 

This cartel of effects
includes crackling tail to
red, white and blue,
whistling tail to orange and
blue w/ gold glitter, and
whirling tail to
chrysanthemum.

Duration: 32 secs.

Product Code: MS129

Our Price: $130.90 

Cakes / Repeaters

EVIL ENEMY - 36
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 12 pieces
per case. 

Looking for the perfect
multi shot? Look no
further. Red, green and
blue tails to silver spinners
invade the sky, then
alternating red palms and
green palms with white
glitter finish it off. A great
complement to MS202
Bling Bling. 

Duration: 30 secs.

Product Code: MS203

Our Price: $157.90 

Cakes / Repeaters

FALCON RISING - 16
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 12 pieces
per case. 

One of our best selling
multi-shot cakes of all
time. Crackling dragon
tails to multi-colored
bouquets with a quickened
10 shot finale.

Product Code: MS128

Our Price: $131.20 

Cakes / Repeaters

FEATS OF
STRENGTH -
ASSORTED

Case Quantity: 12 pieces
per case. 

All aerials, all the time.
Makes a great show for
the family or a weekend
BBQ. Includes: MS306
Great Expectation, MS305
Broken Heart, Hard Cobra,
MS304 Mercurial Bee,
Metal Dino, Strong Man,
Eye Candy, Angel Rising,
Pure Pleasure, MS302 Out
Of Control, and Aerobatics
Show.

Product Code: MS310

Our Price: $159.50 

Cakes / Repeaters
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FISH FRENZY - 9
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 48 pieces
per case. 

This quiet cake scatters
silver fish through the air. A
great quiet effect.

Duration: 15 sec.

Product Code: MS115

Our Price: $171.60 

Cakes / Repeaters

FLABBERGASTED -
20 SHOTS

Case Quantity: 16 pieces
per case (20 shots each).

A show of flower-crown
breaks with color pistil. A
flabbergasting effect!

Product Code: MS632

Our Price: $206.00 

Cakes / Repeaters

GOLDEN PEACOCK -
16 SHOTS

Case Quantity: 24 pieces
per case. 

Green tail to green
bouquets with crackling.
16 SHOTS

Product Code: MS187

Our Price: $167.20 

Cakes / Repeaters

GREATEST HITS - 16
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 12 pieces
per case (16 shots each).

Read More

Product Code: MS133

Our Price: $135.40 

Cakes / Repeaters
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HAPPY - 16 SHOT

Case Quantity: 48 pieces
per case. 

A fireworks classic that
sells by the thousands year
after year. Puts on a
display of 16 aerial shots
with alternating red &
green breaks and
firecrackers. One of the
best values in fireworks.

Product Code: MS140

Our Price: $131.60 

Cakes / Repeaters

HAPPY - 36 SHOT

Case Quantity: 24 pieces
per case. 

A classic multi-shot, Happy
fires off 36 shots of
alternating colored comets
with firecracker reports. A
great item that the whole
family can enjoy.

Product Code: MS141

Our Price: $132.50 

Cakes / Repeaters

HAPPY - 36 SHOTS

Case Quantity: 24 pieces
per case. 

A classic multi-shot, Happy
fires off 36 shots of
alternating colored comets
with firecracker reports. A
great item that the whole
family can enjoy. 

Duration: 40 secs.

Product Code: MS144

Our Price: $140.70 

Cakes / Repeaters

INSTANT REPLAY -
12 SHOTS

Case Quantity: 12 pieces
per case. 

A great new twelve-shot
from Brothers. Instant
Replay has bright crackling
tails to alternating red and
green palms with delayed
chrysanthemum. Very
similar to GM160 Firefly,
but at a 200 gram price!

Product Code: MS329

Our Price: $156.40 

Cakes / Repeaters
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JEWEL HEIST - 16
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 18 pieces
per case (16 shots each).

Glittering gems of red
peony with white strobe,
green peony with red
strobe, purple peony with
green strobe, and blue
peony with gold strobe
twinkle in the night.

DIMENSIONS 6.1 L × 3.9 W
× 4.8 H

Product Code: MS132

Our Price: $124.10 

Cakes / Repeaters

KILLER CAKE - 19
SHOT

Case Quantity: 8 pieces per
case. 

If looks could kill, this cake
would be deadly. Fires 19
shots of gold wave with
assorted color pistils. A
killer effect!

Product Code: MS470

Our Price: $139.00 

Cakes / Repeaters

LUCK O THE IRISH -
ORIGINAL LABEL -
12 SHOTS

Case Quantity: 12 pieces
per case. 

Feeling lucky? These ten
shots of green tails to
silver brocade to
alternating red and green
stars and a final two shots
of delayed crackling will
make you a winner every
time. 

Duration: 25 sec

Product Code: MS275B

Our Price: $154.90 

Cakes / Repeaters

MAGNIFICENT
FESTIVAL - 25
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 12 pieces
per case. 

A celebration just isn't the
same without Magnificent
Festival. Blue tails to multi-
colored bouquets with
crackling to a 10-shot
finale. Great item with lots
of action.

Duration: 30 sec.

Product Code: MS172

Our Price: $152.90 

Cakes / Repeaters
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MECHANICAL BUG -
100 SHOTS

Case Quantity: 8 pieces per
case. 

Watch as these
Mechanical Bugs fly out of
the cake and into your
night sky. Silver flying fish
with blue star effects lead
to whistling and crackling
tails to reports. 

Duration: 55 secs.

Product Code: MS173

Our Price: $163.50 

Cakes / Repeaters

MOBILE MENACE -
35 SHOT

Case Quantity: 12 pieces
per case. 

Clear the road for
alternating red and green
glitter, v-shaped titanium
flower tails with whistles,
silver swirling tails with
whistles, v-shaped
crackling comet tails and a
crackling finale.

Product Code: MS427

Our Price: $174.30 

Cakes / Repeaters

NEON WORLD - 18
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 8 pieces per
case. 

Light up your world with
combinations of red, green,
blue, and yellow stars
accompanied by silver,
gold, and green glitter.

Duration: 35 sec.

Product Code: MS104

Our Price: $120.20 

Cakes / Repeaters

NOISY - 12 SHOT

Case Quantity: 16 pieces
per case. 

This cake turns up the
volume with loud crackling
chrysanthemums and a
finale of blue peonies with
silver glitter.

Product Code: MS417

Our Price: $138.60 

Cakes / Repeaters
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POPPYCOCK - 46
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 12 pieces
per case (46 shots each).

No-nonsense fireworks -
brocade with green glitter
to blue stars with silver
flying fish, then red stars
with crackling flowers.
Crackling tails with
whistles to blue stars with
silver flying fish, then red
stars with crackling
flowers. 46 SHOTS

Product Code: MS630

Our Price: $214.50 

Cakes / Repeaters

QUANTUM ZOO
(ASSORTMENT) - 16
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 24 pieces
per case (16 shots each).

This assortment contains
8 each of Dragon Chrome,
Cadmium Horse, and Hard
Claw. Three classic cakes
with updated labels.

Product Code: MS619

Our Price: $192.70 

Cakes / Repeaters

RED / WHITE / BLUE
- 16 SHOTS

Case Quantity: 12 pieces
per case (16 shots each).

This case contains four
sets of cakes. Each set
contains three aptly-named
cakes: RED, WHITE, and
BLUE. The set comes in a
plastic bag with handles.

Product Code: MS139

Our Price: $151.60 

Cakes / Repeaters

RED WHITE & BLUE -
20 SHOTS

Case Quantity: 18 pieces
per case.

No flag pole can fly the red,
white, and blue as high as
this multi shot! This star-
spangled display is perfect
for your Independence Day
celebrations.

Product Code: MS164

Our Price: $145.10 

Cakes / Repeaters
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SILVER SCREEN - 35
SHOT

Case Quantity: 12 pieces
per case. 

Want a great show? Try
this real-life 3-D action
flick! Sit back and enjoy
crackling tails, v-shaped
silver comet tails, silver
glitter and crackling stars,
v-shaped crackling comet
tails and quickened
crackling stars.

Product Code: MS411

Our Price: $214.70 

Cakes / Repeaters

SKY STREAMERS -
30 SHOT

Sky Bacon brings you Sky
Streamers for some
daytime fireworks fun!
Fires 30 shots of colorful
streamers that dance on
the air and float slowly
back down to earth.

Product Code: MS130

Our Price: $160.00 

Cakes / Repeaters

SUPER MAFIA
BROTHERS

Case Quantity: 1 - 10 piece
ssortment.

Be on the lookout for
Brothers' 10 most wanted.
This set includes: MS 329
Instant Replay, MS128
Falcon Rising, MS194 Wild
West, MS292 Super
Stallion, Martin Bombers,
MS202 Bling-Bling, MS203
Evil Enemy, MS172
Magnificent Festival,
Magic Carpet, and MS188
Red, White, & Blue Salute.

Product Code: MS366

Our Price: $142.10 

Cakes / Repeaters

THE DEADLY DOZEN

Case Quantity: 12 pieces
per case. 

Twelve killer multishots
from Brothers.

Product Code: MS499

Our Price: $190.10 

Cakes / Repeaters
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THE RED WHITE &
BLUE SALUTE - 24
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 12 pieces
per case. 

Salute your country with
this patriotic display from
Brothers. Alternating red,
white and blue tails to red,
white and blue bouquets
and fan-shaped red, white
and blue tails to red, white
and blue bouquets. Three
shots at a time produce
fan-shaped effect. 

Duration: 25 secs.

Product Code: MS188

Our Price: $165.50 

Cakes / Repeaters

TWITTER GLITTER
(SKY BACON)

Case Quantity: 4 pieces per
pack, 18 packs per case
(72 pieces total). 

25 shots - Starts with a
colorful fountain and then
ejects colored stars and
reports with whistle.

Product Code: MS108

Our Price: $152.20 

Cakes / Repeaters

VIVID FX - 96 SHOTS

Case Quantity: 12 cakes
per case (96 shots each). 

A fast-paced show with
plenty of action! Vivid color
pearls, crackle with
bouquets, and crackle with
vivid comet tails z back-
and-forth in the night sky.

Duration: 40 sec.

Product Code: MS567

Our Price: $184.90 

Cakes / Repeaters

WIDOWMAKER - 9
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 12 pieces
per case (9 shots each).

Long spider-legs of flower
crown hang down with
magenta, green, or blue
stars. Its rare to see such
an amazing effect in a 200-
gram cake!

Product Code: MS616

Our Price: $153.10 

Cakes / Repeaters

Page 19Warehouse B Fireworks.us Catalog

https://www.fireworks.us/the-red-white--blue-salute-p/MS188.htm
https://www.fireworks.us/the-red-white--blue-salute-p/MS188.htm
https://www.fireworks.us/twitter-glitter-p/MS108.htm
https://www.fireworks.us/twitter-glitter-p/MS108.htm
https://www.fireworks.us/vivid-fx-fireworks-cake-p/MS567.htm
https://www.fireworks.us/vivid-fx-fireworks-cake-p/MS567.htm
https://www.fireworks.us/widowmaker-p/MS616.htm
https://www.fireworks.us/widowmaker-p/MS616.htm


WILD WEST - 25
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 12 pieces
per case. 

This great cake from
Brothers will get you
hootin' and hollerin'. These
cowboys fire five shots
each of red and white tails
to red and white bouquets,
blue tails to blue stars,
green tails to multi-colored
spinners with reports, and
crackling tails to crackling
bouquets. 

Duration: 25 se... Read
More

Product Code: MS194

Our Price: $159.30 

Cakes / Repeaters

WILDCARD - 49
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 12 pieces
per case (49 shots each).

Go all in with Wildcard
from Brothers. A beast of a
cake that fires crackling
mines to red, green, silver
and lemon palms.
DIMENSIONS 5.5 L × 5.3 W
× 3.3 H

Product Code: MS590

Our Price: $140.50 

Cakes / Repeaters

WILLOW FOREST -
25 SHOTS

Case Quantity: 12 pieces
per case (25 shots each).

Amazing gold-willow
mines lead up to drooping
gold-willow breaks - an
elegant and timeless
display. A spectacular
single-effect cake!

Product Code: MS136

Our Price: $140.60 

Cakes / Repeaters

ALL STAR ACTION
(ORIGINAL LABEL)

Case Quantity: 4 pieces per
pack, 2 packs per case (8
pieces total). 

These 4 assorted cakes
will be the stars of your
fireworks display.

SLAM DUNK - Red, yellow,
green and white tails to
palm and crackling.
Duration: 35 secs.
HAT TRICK - Green and
silver glittering tails to
green palm & red stars
with glitter, gold stars ...
Read More

Product Code: MX113B

Our Price: $149.90 

Cakes - 350 gram
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AMAZING 8

Case Quantity: 8 pieces per
case. 

Quantum brings two of our
best selling cake
assortments - MS136 All-
Star Action and MS137
Brothers Choice - and puts
them together into one
amazing case of fireworks.
8 high-quality 350 gram
cakes from Brothers.

Product Code: MX115

Our Price: $154.00 

Cakes - 350 gram

CURRENT EVENTS -
30 SHOT

Case Quantity: 8 pieces per
case (30 shots each). 

A storm is brewing with
alternating red crackling
stars, green bouquets and
blue bouquets. A great
value from Brothers
packed 8 per case.
Features a five-shot finale. 

Product Code: MX121

Our Price: $190.80 

Cakes - 350 gram

GIGABLASTER - 480
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 6 pieces per
case (480 shots each).

An intense barrage of 480
shots - gold brocade fires
left and right with red,
green, and crackling shots
up the center.

DIMENSIONS 11.8 L × 6.3
W × 9.9 H

Product Code: MX173

Our Price: $189.20 

Cakes - 350 gram

SUMMER SIZZLER -
25 SHOTS

Case Quantity: 8 pieces per
case (25 shots each).

This cake is a scorcher
with zig-zagging crackling
mines to crackling breaks
with color. Unscrew a cold
one with silver swirls
leading to a timerain finale.

DIMENSIONS 8.5 L × 6.1 W
× 6.1 H

Product Code: MX162

Our Price: $136.20 

Cakes - 350 gram
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THE WAR BOX
ASSORTMENT - 15
SHOT

Case Quantity: 6 pieces per
case.

Slam the sky with bright
breaks from this great set.
Firehawk delivers the
goods to take your
neighborhood fireworks
battles to the front line.
When you add this great
set to a fireworks show,
your audience will say,
"Thanks! We love it loud!".
Includes two each of Slam,
Frontline, and ... Read More

Product Code: MX134

Our Price: $164.10 

Cakes - 350 gram

1500-GRAM FINALE
- 72 SHOTS

Case Quantity: 3 pieces per
case (72 shots each).

Three cakes that make for
one great finale! One cake
is angled left, one angled
right, and one straight-up
to fill each piece of the sky.
1500 grams, 72 shots, 35
seconds. The best way to
end your show on a high
note!

Product Code: GM180

Our Price: $160.90 

Cakes - 500 gram

2-MINUTE TERROR -
63 SHOTS

Case Quantity: 3 pieces per
case (63 shots each).

A fantastic two-minute
show of strobe, crackle,
tails, palms, brocade and
more! An action-packed
addition to you night of
fireworks fun.

Product Code: GM1022

Our Price: $167.00 

Cakes - 500 gram

3-MINUTE
MONSTER - 100
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 4 pieces per
case (100 shots each).

Experience 3-full minutes
of fireworks entertainment
with a wide variety of
colors and effects. Color
palms, glitter, crackling
tails, flying fish, brocade
crown and more will keep
you entranced for 180
seconds!

Product Code: GM1023

Our Price: $282.00 

Cakes - 500 gram
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AIR SUPREMACY -
42 SHOTS

Case Quantity: 2 pieces per
case (42 shots each).

This cake dominates the
sky with a mixture of
brocade, strobes, go-
getters, mines, and
timerain chrysanthemums.
A great air show-in-a-box.

Product Code: GM110A

Our Price: $130.10 

Cakes - 500 gram

AMAZING BALLET -
220 SHOTS

Case Quantity: 1 piece per
case. 

Winda's most famous cake
is now available. This cake
pirouettes back and forth
with shots of red, white,
and blue to time rain
chrysanthemums before
leaping with green tails to
reports.

Product Code: GM380

Our Price: $131.00 

Cakes - 500 gram

AMERICA'S
SATURDAY NIGHT
SPECIAL - 36 SHOTS

Case Quantity: 4 pieces per
case (36 shots each).

The long-awaited sequel to
Saturday Night Special - a
Brothers classic! New for
2025!

This 36 shot spectacle
shoots six different
combinations of colorful
explosions. It's a fantastic
experience for everyone.
The different shot
combinations include:

(1) white, green and re...
Read More

Product Code: GM121US

Our Price: $162.90 Cakes - 500 gram

AMERICAN ROAD
TRIP - 49 SHOTS

Case Quantity: 4 pieces per
case (49 shots each).

A red, white, and blue
version of Hit the Road
Jack. A best-seller from
Brothers in patriotic form.
Celebrate America's 250th
anniversary!

Product Code: GM498US

Our Price: $140.50 

Cakes - 500 gram
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BACKYARD KING -
45 SHOTS

Case Quantity: 4 pieces per
case (45 shots each). 

You'll be the talk of the
neighborhood with the
bright comets and colorful,
loud breaks from Backyard
King. A spectacular display
to cap off a night of
fireworks fun.

Product Code: GM116

Our Price: $226.90 

Cakes - 500 gram

BLOND JOKE - 36
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 4 pieces per
case (36 shots each). 

This is one outstanding
cake. Crackling comet tails
rise up to alternating red
crackling stars, green, or
gold bouquets. With a 12
shot HUGE finale. 

One of our all-time best
sellers! If you don't have
this cake in your display
your audience is missing
out.

Duration: 45 secs. Read
More

Product Code: GM114

Our Price: $153.20 

Cakes - 500 gram

BLUE BLITZ - 80
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 2 pieces per
case. 

An amazing cake that's a
staff favorite. This 500-
gram beast sounds like a
gattling gun as it fires a
zig-zagging onslaught of
blue tails blitzing across
the sky with an incendiary
display of purple stars and
green flying fish. 

Duration: 20 secs.

Product Code: GM195

Our Price: $169.00 

Cakes - 500 gram

BULL MARKET - 42
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 4 pieces per
case (42 shots each).

Read More

Product Code: GM866

Our Price: $242.70 

Cakes - 500 gram
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CONTAINER LOAD
BLUE - 12 SHOTS

Case Quantity: 4 pieces per
case (12 shots each).

4 superior 500-gram cakes
packed in a single case!
Contains War Stopper,
Reach for the Sky, Super
Kung-Fu, and Super Stunt.
12-shot powerhouse
cakes.

DIMENSIONS 11.0 L × 10.3
W × 8.9 H

Product Code: GM963

Our Price: $285.90 

Cakes 500 gram

DA BIG BOMB BOX

Case Quantity: 4 pieces per
case (36 shots each). 

One of our best sellers, Da
Big Bomb Box offers four
different and amazing
cakes; Atom Bomb,
Hydrogen Bomb, Neutron
Bomb and Cobalt Bomb.
Each cake lasts 45
seconds and is a 36-shot
destroyer with a 12-shot
finale. 

Product Code: GM100

Our Price: $153.00 

Cakes - 500 gram

EAGLE'S TALON - 33
SHOTS EACH

Case Quantity: 3 pieces per
case (33 shots each). 

The amazing patriotic
colors in this cake will give
you a truly American
display. Effects include
glitter, multi-colored stars,
crackling, palms and
chrysanthemum, with a
finale of golden willows. 

Duration: 50 seconds.

Product Code: GM174

Our Price: $137.80 

Cakes - 500 gram

ENGINE NO. 9 - 16
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 4 pieces per
case. 

Engine No. 9 is a cake that
is unbelievable! Sure to be
a Brothers classic. Clear
the way for an alternating
spectacle of golden
willows to a combination
of multicolored stars to
crackling with a quickened
four shot finale. A staff
favorite! Duration: 50 secs.

Product Code: GM250

Our Price: $126.60 

Cakes - 500 gram
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FLOOD RED WHITE &
BLUE - 61 SHOTS

Case Quantity: 4 pieces per
case (61 shots each).

The patriotic sequel to
Flood Red - one of
Brothers' best cakes! Flood
your night with red, white,
and blue. Color crackling
willow mines start things
off, and color crackling
stars finish the show. New
for 2025! Just in time for
the 250th anniversary of
America!

Product Code: GM336US

Our Price: $242.00 

Cakes - 500 gram

G.O.A.T.
ASSORTMENT - 10
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 4 pieces per
case (10 shots each).

Greatest Brocade of all
Time: GINORMOUS GOLD
PINE BROCADE - Gold Pine
to Red Heart, Strobing
Heart, Blue Heart, Silver
Tail to Gold Pine Purple
Heart. Ends with Rapid
Silver tail to Gold Pine
Loud Crackling


Greatest Peony of all Time:
IT IS HUGE! - Red Green
Blue Peony, P... Read More

Product Code: GM832

Our Price: $222.20 

Cakes - 500 gram

HARDCORE CYCLES
- 16 SHOTS

Case Quantity: 4 pieces per
case (16 shots each).

Nothing compares to the
roar of a chopper, except
for these four custom
cakes from Bright Star. Rip
open the full-color case to
find:

Ghost Rider - tails to strobe
with color-changing
dahlias and gold crown.

Road & Roll - tails to spider
breaks with color strobes.

Hell ... Read More

Product Code: GM1018

Our Price: $153.90 

Cakes - 500 gram

HAWGWARTS - 30
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 4 pieces per
case (30 shots each).

A panoramic display of
silver tails to brocade
crown or color palms
alternating with tourbillion
tails to spitting color
strobes or falling leaves.
Awesomely rich display
from ground to sky!

Product Code: GM181

Our Price: $169.70 

Cakes - 500 gram
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HIGH FALUTIN - 49
SHOT

Case Quantity: 4 pieces per
case.

High Falutin features
impressive breaks and
puts on a great display
with a duration of 60
seconds. Effects include
red, green or blue tails to
red, green or blue
bouquets, alternating
silver, gold, or purple tails
to silver glitter, gold
willows or crackling. A
crackling comet tail barr...
Read More

Product Code: GM497

Our Price: $137.70 

Cakes - 500 gram

HIT THE ROAD JACK
- 49 SHOTS

Case Quantity: 4 pieces per
case (49 shots each). 

It is time for lame
fireworks to get packing.
Hit the Road, Jack shows
them up with a big display
of red and silver tails to
bouquets, blue tails to blue
stars, green tails to red,
blue, and silver glitter, gold
tails to brocade, purple
tails to delayed crackling,
and wh... Read More

Product Code: GM498

Our Price: $136.30 

Cakes - 500 gram

HOOLIGAN - 49
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 6 pieces per
case. 

A rowdy clash of blue tails
to golden spinners with
silver flying fish alternating
with red comet tails to a
rumble of whistling
spinners with reports. 

Duration: 70 secs.

Product Code: GM245

Our Price: $183.20 

Cakes - 500 gram

HYDROGEN BOMB -
36 SHOTS

Case Quantity: 4 pieces per
case. 

A mushroom cloud of
colored mines to multi-
colored spinners with
reports. Also available as
part of GM100 Da Big
Bomb Box. 

Duration: 45 sec.

Product Code: GM262

Our Price: $157.30 

Cakes - 500 gram
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I LOVE FIREWORKS -
22 SHOT

Case Quantity: 4 pieces per
case.

Show your love for
fireworks by firing this 22-
shot piece from Brothers.
Features red, yellow, and
purple comets with green
glitter, red and yellow
crackling, silver brocade,
orange with green glitter,
yellow and green crackling,
and three big shots of red
and green stars.

Product Code: GM500

Our Price: $190.50 

Cakes - 500 gram

IPA 4-PACK - 36
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 4 pieces per
case (36 shots each).

Read More

Product Code: GM880

Our Price: $213.00 

Cakes - 500 gram

LUCHA LIBRE
ASSORTMENT - 14
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 4 pieces per
case (14 shots each).

Shoot fireworks like a pro
with this set of assorted
500 grams from Sky
Bacon. Includes El Diablo,
El Tigre, El Toro, and La
Serpiente. Unique triangle
packaging!

Product Code: GM1027

Our Price: $120.40 

Cakes - 500 gram

MAJOR COMBAT -
119 SHOTS

Case Quantity: 1 piece per
case (119 shots each).

This cake is a display in
itself! Over a minute long
with varied effects. Hit
them fast and hard with a
big assortment of
crackling flowers, fanned
multicolored comet tails
with reports, red and green
tails to silver spinners with
reports, blue tails to silver
flying fis... Read More

Product Code: GM133

Our Price: $137.20 

Cakes - 500 gram
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MAKE SOME NOISE -
25 SHOTS

Case Quantity: 4 pieces per
case (25 shots each).

This cakes gives itself a
round of applause with
fanned shots of crackling
mines up to crackling
breaks. A great single-
effect cake that really
makes some noise!

DIMENSIONS 9.9 L × 11.0
W × 6.9 H

Product Code: GM204

Our Price: $143.30 

Cakes - 500 gram

MECHAPIGZILLA -
136 SHOTS

Case Quantity: 1 piece per
case (136 shots each).

Nothing could stand up to
the mythical power of
Pigzilla... until now. Hide
your kids, hide your
skyscrapers from these
pastel shots of purple,
yellow, and blue.
Screaming rockets mount
an air defense leading to
mechanical rain. More
vibrant comets lead to
crackling come... Read
More

Product Code: GM171

Our Price: $162.80 

Cakes - 500 gram

METEOR STRIKE -
168 SHOTS

Case Quantity: 1 piece per
case (168 shots each).

Read More

Product Code: GM197

Our Price: $132.80 

Cakes - 500 gram

MOB MADNESS - 49
SHOT ASSORTMENT

Case Quantity: 4 pieces per
case (49 shots each). 

This set is breaking bad
with 4 different 49-shot
fireworks shows. Contains
Crime Scene, Inside Job,
Blood Money, and Turf War
- each one a great display
with assorted effects.

Product Code: GM760

Our Price: $142.10 

Cakes - 500 gram
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MT RUSHMORE
(ASSORTED) 9 SHOT

Case Quantity: 4 piece
case (9 shots each). 

Enjoy the expansive breaks
from these majestic 9-shot
cakes. Big, loud breaks
with assorted effects.


Product Code: GM106

Our Price: $148.80 

Cakes - 500 gram

NISHIKI 1500-GRAM
FINALE - 72 SHOTS

Case Quantity: 3 pieces per
case (72 shots each).

A beautiful all-gold finale -
the best way to end any
show! Elegant and
mesmerizing, these gold
willows hang and sway in
the air for a memorable
fireworks scene.

Product Code: GM180A

Our Price: $160.90 

Cakes - 500 gram

OUT WITH A BANG -
295 SHOT

Case Quantity: 1 piece per
case (295 shots) 

A big build-up with Z-
shaped alternating rows of
silver wave to blue stars,
gold comet tails and
crackling comet tails.
Then, rows of whistles, and
a BANG of five
simultaneous shots of
brocade and a five-shot
finale of timerain crackling.
295 SHOTS

Product Code: GM602

Our Price: $166.10 

Cakes - 500 gram

PARTY LIKE ITS
1776 - 156 SHOTS

Case Quantity: 2 pieces per
case (156 shots each).

Let freedom ring like it’s
1776! Blue to red strobe
tails and crackling silver
palms with red strobes
pistils light up the sky.

Product Code: GM876

Our Price: $254.80 

Cakes - 500 gram

Page 30Warehouse B Fireworks.us Catalog

https://www.fireworks.us/mt-rushmore-assorted-p/GM106.htm
https://www.fireworks.us/mt-rushmore-assorted-p/GM106.htm
https://www.fireworks.us/nishiki-1500-gram-finale-p/GM180A.htm
https://www.fireworks.us/nishiki-1500-gram-finale-p/GM180A.htm
https://www.fireworks.us/out-with-a-bang-p/GM602.htm
https://www.fireworks.us/out-with-a-bang-p/GM602.htm
https://www.fireworks.us/party-like-its-1776-p/GM876.htm
https://www.fireworks.us/party-like-its-1776-p/GM876.htm


PIGZILLA - 142
SHOT

Case Quantity: 1 piece per
case (142 shots). 

Frighten the neighbors
with this monster that
terrorizes with zigzagging
color pearls to whistling,
crackling, and ends with
walls of brocade and
crackle.

Duration: 35 sec.

Product Code: GM135

Our Price: $134.50 

Cakes - 500 gram

PORTAL - 9 SHOTS

Case Quantity: 4 pieces per
case (9 shots each).

True 2-inch ball shells blast
into brocade ring with red
and blue. A 2-shot finale of
glitter and crackle open up
a parallel dimension.

DIMENSIONS 11.0 L × 11.0
W × 9.8 H

Product Code: GM187

Our Price: $226.40 

Cakes - 500 gram

RAINBOW - 25
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 4 pieces per
case (25 shots each).

Enjoy the colors of the
rainbow spread across the
sky. Vibrant hues make
this a fan-favorite.

Product Code: GM634B

Our Price: $192.30 

Cakes - 500 gram

SKY PATRIOT - 25
SHOT

Case Quantity: 4 pieces per
case (25 shots each). 

Stand up and salute as this
cake carpets the sky. Red,
white, and blue mines lead
up to booming breaks of
red, white, and blue.

Product Code: GM105

Our Price: $201.80 

Cakes - 500 gram
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SWEET 16S - 16
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 4 pieces per
case (16 shots each). 

Two things we love at
Fireworks.us are Brothers
500-gram cakes and
variety. This case meets
both criteria with one piece
each of Uncle Sams
Answer, Photo Finish,
Engine No. 9 and
Pyronation. A powerful set!

Product Code: GM620

Our Price: $189.50 

Cakes - 500 gram

SWINENADO - 182
SHOT

Case Quantity: 1 piece per
case (182 shots). 

This prairie-ripping cake
features loud crackling
comets with alternating
blue, lemon and purple
pearls. Ends with large
breaks of brocade crown.

Product Code: GM117

Our Price: $138.90 

Cakes - 500 gram

THE HOG FATHER -
30 SHOTS

Case Quantity: 4 pieces per
case (30 shots each). 

A single-effect cake with
30 great shots! Each break
features intense neon
colors followed by a loud
bacon crackle. A deal you
cannot refuse!

Duration: 45 sec.

Product Code: GM142

Our Price: $192.70 

Cakes - 500 gram

WILD CACTUS - 15
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 4 pieces per
case (15 shots each). 

Just watch as this cake
pumps 15 wild cacti into
the sky! Effects include
golden willows to red stars,
white glittering willows,
crackling flowers and
willows with a three shot
crackling willow finale. 

Duration 45 secs.

Product Code: GM166

Our Price: $150.60 

Cakes - 500 gram
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Z GOLD GLITTER
COMETS - 130
SHOTS (35 SEC)

Case Quantity: 2 pieces per
case (130 shots each).

130 gold comets with gold
glittering tail. Shoots back
and forth at a stead pace
with very little sound.

Product Code: GM629S

Our Price: $156.50 

Cakes - 500 gram

1.5IN FIRECRACKER
(WATER CRACKER)

Case Quantity: 100
crackers per pack, 100
packs per case (10,000
crackers total).

Also known as water
dynamite, these
firecrackers are individually
fused with as much
powder as allowed by law.
Creates a loud, satisfying
BANG.

Product Code: FR140

Our Price: $122.10 

Firecrackers

SERIOUS CRACKER

Case Quantity: 6 crackers
per pack, 24 packs per
case (144 crackers total).

Want some more BANG for
your buck? Try Serious
Cracker this year. A
technological revolution,
each unit is made up of
tightly packed firecrackers
quick-fused for an
instantaneous pyro
explosion!

Product Code: FR139

Our Price: $142.10 

Firecrackers

THUNDERBOMB
FIRECRACKERS -
(15,360 CRACKERS)

Case Quantity: 16 crackers
per pack, 40 packs per
brick, 24 bricks per case
(15,360 crackers total).

Top quality firecrackers
with that loud "BANG" that
brings a smile to the pyro
in each of us. Each stick is
filled with the maximum
composition allowed by
law. Each small pack
contains 16 firecrackers
fused together.

Product Code: FR130

Our Price: $127.20 

Firecrackers
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THUNDERBOMB
FIRECRACKERS -
(16,000 CRACKERS)

Case Quantity: 16,000
crackers per roll, 1 rolls per
case (16,000 crackers
total).

Top quality firecrackers
with that loud "BANG" that
brings a smile to the pyro
in each of us. Each stick is
filled with the maximum
composition allowed by
law. Each roll contains
16,000 firecrackers fused
together.

Product Code: FR136

Our Price: $116.00 

Firecrackers

THUNDERBOMB
FIRECRACKERS -
(16,000 CRACKERS)

Case Quantity: 4,000
crackers per roll, 4 rolls per
case (16,000 crackers
total).

Top quality firecrackers
with that loud "BANG" that
brings a smile to the pyro
in each of us. Each stick is
filled with the maximum
composition allowed by
law. Each roll contains
4,000 firecrackers fused
together.

Product Code: FR135

Our Price: $114.80 

Firecrackers

THUNDERBOMB
FIRECRACKERS -
(16,000 CRACKERS)

Case Quantity: 1,000
crackers per roll, 16 rolls
per case (16,000 crackers
total).

Top quality firecrackers
with that loud "BANG" that
brings a smile to the pyro
in each of us. Each stick is
filled with the maximum
composition allowed by
law. Each roll contains
1,000 firecrackers fused
together.

Product Code: FR134

Our Price: $115.80 

Firecrackers

THUNDERBOMB
FIRECRACKERS -
(16,000 CRACKERS)

Case Quantity: 200
crackers per pack, 10
packs per brick, 8 bricks
per case (16,000 crackers
total).

Top quality firecrackers
with that loud "BANG" that
brings a smile to the pyro
in each of us. Each stick is
filled with the maximum
composition allowed by
law. Each pack contains
200 firecrackers fused
together.

Product Code: FR133

Our Price: $118.20 

Firecrackers
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THUNDERBOMB
FIRECRACKERS -
(16,000 CRACKERS)

Case Quantity: 100
crackers per pack, 20
packs per brick, 8 bricks
per case (16,000 crackers
total).

Top quality firecrackers
with that loud "BANG" that
brings a smile to the pyro
in each of us. Each stick is
filled with the maximum
composition allowed by
law. Each pack contains
100 firecrackers fused
together.

Product Code: FR132

Our Price: $116.90 

Firecrackers

THUNDERBOMB
FIRECRACKERS -
(16,000 CRACKERS)

Case Quantity: 50 crackers
per pack, 40 packs per
brick, 8 bricks per case
(16,000 crackers total).

Top quality firecrackers
with that loud "BANG" that
brings a smile to the pyro
in each of us. Each stick is
filled with the maximum
composition allowed by
law. Each pack contains 50
firecrackers fused
together.

Product Code: FR131

Our Price: $122.10 

Firecrackers

4-ELEMENTS: FIRE,
WATER, WIND,
EARTH

Case Quantity: 4 pieces per
pack, 72 packs per case.
288 total pieces. 

4 assorted fountains that
all ages will enjoy. Effects
include red, green, gold,
and purple colors with
crackles.

Product Code: FN157

Our Price: $118.60 

Fountains

4TH OF JULY CONIC
- 8"

Case Quantity: 96 pieces
per case.

This patriotic fountain is a
great value with red
bouquet to silver
chrysanthemums to
crackling to blue.

Product Code: FN133

Our Price: $195.30 

Fountains
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AMERICA FOREVER

Case Quantity: 8 fountains
per case.

Our longest-lasting
fountain! Get 220 seconds
worth of color pearls,
crackle, popcorn, flying
fish, dragon eggs and
more! Lasts over 3-1/2
minutes!

Duration: 220 sec.

Product Code: FN127

Our Price: $129.70 

Fountains

BEES KNEES

Case Quantity: 24 pieces
per case. 

This hive erupts with silver
and gold crackling, along
with color stars of blue,
lemon, purple, red and
green. An intense piece.

Product Code: FN376

Our Price: $146.00 

Fountains

BOOM BARREL

Case Quantity: 48 pieces
per case.

A great value fountain
featuring gold crackling
flowers with blue, red
flaming spray, silver
crackle with color pearls. A
barrel full of fun!

Product Code: FN107

Our Price: $134.00 

Fountains

CRAYON
MELTDOWN

Case Quantity: 24 pieces
per case.

All the colors in the box
spring out in vibrant
fashion. A mesmerizing
effect commonly know as
jelly beans or lava droplets.

Duration: 62 sec.

Product Code: FN128

Our Price: $210.90 

Fountains
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CUCKOO

Case Quantity: 6 pieces per
box, 24 boxes per case.
Total quantity 144 pieces.

A classic fountain, Cuckoo
puts on a great show of
multi-colored sparks and
loud whistles.

Product Code: FN102

Our Price: $162.80 

Fountains

DANCING WITH
GHOST

Case Quantity: 24 pieces
per case. 

A great fountain with
dancing fish! Features red,
green and blue fish, giant
crackling, and melted-iron
flower with blue pearls.

Product Code: FN347

Our Price: $169.20 

Fountains

DEVILS STAIRS/
EVILS STAIRS

Case Quantity: 12 pieces
per case. 

This great fountain has
spectacular stair-step
packaging that really
stands out. Performance
comes from six effect
tubes featuring whistles,
gold & silver crackles,
multi-colored pearls,
chrysanthemums and
crazy crackling finale.
Duration: 2:00.

Product Code: FN156

Our Price: $230.50 

Fountains

EXTRA ZESTY

Case Quantity: 24 pieces
per case. 

Put a spring in your step
with the extra zesty dollop
of crackling flowers and a
silver crackling shower
with blue pearls, then a
gold crackling shower with
blue pearls.

Product Code: FN342

Our Price: $140.40 

Fountains
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EYES ON U

This fountain is definitely
an eye-catcher. A great
value, Eyes-On-U is a lot of
punch in a little package.

Product Code: FN281

Our Price: $157.60 

Fountains

GEYSER CONIC
FOUNTAIN (60/4)

Case Quantity: 4 pieces per
pack, 60 packs per case.
(240 total pieces.)

4 assorted conic fountains
(red, green, blue, and
yellow). Each fountain is 4-
inches tall.

Product Code: FN216

Our Price: $204.20 

Fountains

HULA GIRL (24/4)

Case Quantity: 4 pieces per
pack, 24 packs per case.
96 total pieces.

This girl can do the Hula
with a yellow torch with
whistling and golden
chrysanthemums.
Sparklers in her hand add
to the fun. 

Duration: 40 sec.

Product Code: FN165

Our Price: $214.70 

Fountains

JACK IN THE BOX

Case Quantity: 6 pieces per
pack, 30 packs per case
(180 total pieces).

Jack in the Box puts on a
show of fountain effects
before expelling color
ground spinners.

Product Code: FN235

Our Price: $157.70 

Fountains
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KOI POND

Case Quantity: 12 pieces
per case. 

Koi Pond starts with a
silver fountain, then color
droplets to silk
chrysanthemum and a
crackling finale. An ocean
of fun!

Product Code: FN385

Our Price: $140.20 

Fountains

NAUGHTY BOYS

Case Quantity: 6 pieces per
box, 36 boxes per case.
(216 total pieces)

Naughty Boys is a small,
intense crackling fountain.
After burning for 2
minutes, nothing is left - no
paper, no clay, no tube, no
mess!

Product Code: FN104

Our Price: $125.70 

Fountains

NEON JELLY BEANS

Case Quantity: 8 pieces per
case. 

Neon Jelly Beans is a
colorful and crackling
fountain with blue, red,
lemon jelly beans, with
popcorn flowers and silver
crackle!

Duration: 50 sec.

Product Code: FN401

Our Price: $159.30 

Fountains

NO. 3 CONIC
FOUNTAIN

Case Quantity: 36 pieces
per box, 20 boxes per case.
(720 pieces)

Classic #3 medium conic
fountain in a great new Sky
Bacon label.

Product Code: FN105

Our Price: $201.60 

Fountains
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OLD FAITHFUL - 8"
CONIC

Case Quantity: 2 pieces per
pack, 16 packs per case
(32 total pieces).

A true conic fountain! This
display builds as it burns.

Duration: 35 sec.

Product Code: FN119

Our Price: $147.30 

Fountains

FLAME OF
THRONES

Case Quantity: 4 pieces per
case. 

Unite the kingdoms with
banners of blue, red, green!
This fanned fountain will
wow the crowds with
chrysanthemums, colored
pearls, wide silver sprays,
intense crackle, popcorn
and a crackling finish.

Duration: 1 min. 17 sec.

Product Code: FG126

Our Price: $130.70 

Fountains - 500 gram

FORTUNE SOLDIER

Case Quantity: 9 pieces per
case. 

One of Winda's top sellers,
now available from
Fireworks.us. Puts on a
long display of pine
needles, crackle, whistles,
chrysanthemums, and
multicolor stars. Lasts
almost 3 minutes!

Get more bang for your
buck with 9 of these
amazing fountains per
case!

Duration: 2:50

Product Code: FG120

Our Price: $142.10 

Fountains - 500 gram

KANGO HOP

Case Quantity: 8 pieces per
case. 

See how they celebrate
down under. This 2 1/2
minute fountain features
crackling flowers, whistles,
and red, blue, yellow, and
purple stars. 

Duration: 2:20.

Product Code: FG100

Our Price: $164.70 

Fountains - 500 gram
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PARTY PYROMETER

Case Quantity: 4 pieces per
case. 

This fountain is your
measure of fireworks fun.
A long-lasting fan fountain
with an amazing display of
popcorn, crackle, golden
showers and colorful
pearls to an intense
crackling finale.

Duration: 80 sec.

Product Code: FG118

Our Price: $123.30 

Fountains - 500 gram

3MM SAFETY FUSE
(12-15 SEC/FT) - 10
ROLLS

Case Quantity: 10 20 ft
rolls per case (200 total
feet).

20 ft rolls - High-quality
visco fuse made in
Cambodia. Burns on
average 12-15 sec/ft, but
varies based on temp,
elevation, and humidity.
Please test before using in
a show. Cannot be shipped
parcel due to UN0336 DOT
classification.

Product Code: FE153C

Our Price: $180.70 

Cannon Fuse & Igniters

3MM SAFETY FUSE
(12-15 SEC/FT) - 120
ROLLS

Case Quantity: 120 20 ft
rolls per case (2,400 total
feet).

20 ft rolls - High-quality
visco fuse made in
Cambodia. Burns on
average 12-15 sec/ft, but
varies based on temp,
elevation, and humidity.
Please test before using in
a show. Cannot be shipped
parcel due to UN0336 DOT
classification. 120/20ft
rolls = Master Case

Product Code: FE153

Our Price: $1,282.40 

Cannon Fuse & Igniters

3MM SAFETY FUSE
(12-15 SEC/FT) - 30
ROLLS

Case Quantity: 30 20 ft
rolls per case (600 total
feet).

20 ft rolls - High-quality
visco fuse made in
Cambodia. Burns on
average 12-15 sec/ft, but
varies based on temp,
elevation, and humidity.
Please test before using in
a show. Cannot be shipped
parcel due to UN0336 DOT
classification.

Product Code: FE153B

Our Price: $415.10 

Cannon Fuse & Igniters
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3MM SAFETY FUSE
(15-20 SEC/FT) - 10
ROLLS

Case Quantity: 10 20 ft
rolls per case (200 total
feet).

20 ft rolls - High-quality
visco fuse made in
Cambodia. Burns on
average 15-20 sec/ft, but
varies based on temp,
elevation, and humidity.
Please test before using in
a show. Cannot be shipped
parcel due to UN0336 DOT
classification.

Product Code: FE152C

Our Price: $175.50 

Cannon Fuse & Igniters

3MM SAFETY FUSE
(15-20 SEC/FT) - 120
ROLLS

Case Quantity: 120 20 ft
rolls per case (2,400 total
feet).

20 ft rolls - High-quality
visco fuse made in
Cambodia. Burns on
average 15-20 sec/ft, but
varies based on temp,
elevation, and humidity.
Please test before using in
a show. Cannot be shipped
parcel due to UN0336 DOT
classification. 120/20ft
rolls in case = Mas... Read
More

Product Code: FE152

Our Price: $1,221.20 

Cannon Fuse & Igniters

3MM SAFETY FUSE
(15-20 SEC/FT) - 30
ROLLS

Case Quantity: 30 20 ft
rolls per case (600 total
feet).

20 ft rolls - High-quality
visco fuse made in
Cambodia. Burns on
average 15-20 sec/ft, but
varies based on temp,
elevation, and humidity.
Please test before using in
a show. Cannot be shipped
parcel due to UN0336 DOT
classification.

Product Code: FE152B

Our Price: $396.00 

Cannon Fuse & Igniters

3MM SAFETY FUSE
(20-25 SEC/FT) - 10
ROLLS

Case Quantity: 10 20 ft
rolls per case (200 total
feet).

20 ft rolls - High-quality
visco fuse made in
Cambodia. Burns on
average 20-25 sec/ft, but
varies based on temp,
elevation, and humidity.
Please test before using in
a show. Cannot be shipped
parcel due to UN0336 DOT
classification.

Product Code: FE151C

Our Price: $170.30 

Cannon Fuse & Igniters
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3MM SAFETY FUSE
(20-25 SEC/FT) - 30
ROLLS

Case Quantity: 30 20 ft
rolls per case (600 total
feet).

20 ft rolls - High-quality
visco fuse made in
Cambodia. Burns on
average 20-25 sec/ft, but
varies based on temp,
elevation, and humidity.
Please test before using in
a show. Cannot be shipped
parcel due to UN0336 DOT
classification.

Product Code: FE151B

Our Price: $376.80 

Cannon Fuse & Igniters

3MM SAFETY FUSE
(ASSORTED) - 15
ROLLS

Case Quantity: 15 20 ft
rolls per case (300 total
feet).

An assortment of fuse - 5
rolls each of:

- Safety Fuse (3mm) 20-25
sec/ft
- Safety Fuse (3mm) 15-20
sec/ft
- Safety Fuse (3mm) 12-15
sec/ft

High-quality visco fuse
made in Cambodia. Speed
varies based on temp,
elevation, and humidity.
Please test before using in

Product Code: FE159

Our Price: $227.30
Cannon Fuse & Igniters

FUSE CONNEX - 100
PACKS OF 10

Receive free shipping on
this item!

Case Quantity: 10 pieces
per pack, 100 packs per
case (1,000 total pieces).

Fuse ConneX are a safe,
easy, and fun way to create
your own fireworks display.
Just run your main fuse
down the center and
attach the fuse from your
fireworks into the sides,
touching the main fuse.
Press the ... Read More

Product Code: FE111

Our Price: $238.70 

Cannon Fuse & Igniters

10 SHOT
FIBERGLASS RACK

Case Quantity: 1, 10 shot
rack.

Our 10-shot racks are
perfect for setting up
multiple firing stations, or
combining at the angles
you need. Each unit comes
complete with 10
fiberglass mortars
designed for 60-gram
canisters, ball shells, and
more!

Product Code: MR128

Our Price: $171.80 

Mortar Tubes and Racks
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FIBERGLASS
MORTARS 1.91"

Case Quantity: 50
fiberglass tubes per case.

Quality fiberglass mortars
made for 1.75" shells,
including Hellcat Cans,
Smoke N Mirrors,
Supernovas, American
Chief, and others.

Product Code: MR127A

Our Price: $253.40 

Mortar Tubes and Racks

AIR FORCE FLEET

Case Quantity: 6 pieces per
pack, 50 packs per case
(300 pieces total).

A pack of assorted flying
novelties. Each box
contains the following:
2pcs B-3 Spy Plane
2pcs U-2 Bomber Plane
2pcs Plane Drops
Parachute

Product Code: NF211

Our Price: $191.40 

Novelties - Flying

BUZZ BANG

Case Quantity: 3 pieces per
pack, 80 packs per case
(240 pieces total).

One of our favorite
novelties, Buzz BANG is
sure to please. A lot of fun
for little money, Buzz
BANG flies up into the sky
before bursting with a loud
report. A modern classic! 

Product Code: NF102

Our Price: $166.50 

Novelties - Flying

GREEN WASP

Case Quantity: 6 pieces per
pack, 96 packs per case
(576 pieces total).

A great flying novelty,
Green Wasp zips up into
the air with a green glow
and a trail of crackle.

Product Code: NF107

Our Price: $186.50 

Novelties - Flying
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LADYBUGS (40/3)

Case Quantity: 3 pieces per
pack, 40 packs per case
(120 pieces total). 

Everyone wants to light off
a Ladybug! These unique
fliers spin and shoot up
with red and green lights,
ending in a shower of
silver flowers.

Product Code: NF112A

Our Price: $201.40 

Novelties - Flying

PYRO GYRO

Case Quantity: 3 pieces per
pack, 24 packs per case
(72 pieces total).

Cool looking novelties that
fly up with assorted
effects. 
1) Red light with silver
whistle and white light 
2) silver strobe with silver
whistle and red light 
3) blue light with silver
whistle and green light.

Product Code: NF125

Our Price: $124.70 

Novelties - Flying

SPACE FLYER

Case Quantity: 6 pieces per
pack, 48 packs per case
(288 pieces total).

These little guys get sky
high! Light the Space Flyer
and watch as it spins and
shoots off into outer
space.

Product Code: NF109

Our Price: $110.90 

Novelties - Flying

TWO COLOR SPACE
SHIP

Case Quantity: 6 pieces per
pack, 36 packs per case
(216 pieces total).

The spaceship shoots into
the air, changing color mid-
journey. Makes a great
sound.

Product Code: NF110

Our Price: $147.40 

Novelties - Flying
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ASSORTED SNAKE
BAG

Case Quantity: 6 pieces per
bag, 6 bags per box, 144
boxes per case (5,184
pieces total).

Each bag contains 2 boxes
of glow worms, 2 boxes of
black snakes, and 2 boxes
of colored snakes. A great
little package that every
kid will want. 6 pieces per
box, 6 boxes per pack, 144
packs per case.

Product Code: NV131

Our Price: $143.80 

Novelties - Ground

BLACK SNAKE

Case Quantity: 6 pieces per
pack, 48 packs per box, 15
boxes per case (4320
pieces total).

Upon burning, it produces
a black snake-like ash that
expands in length as the
pellet burns.

Product Code: NV137

Our Price: $128.60 

Novelties - Ground

BOMB BAG

Case Quantity: 72 pieces
per box.

A novelty that kids and
parents love! Crush the
capsule inside and the bag
expands until the seam
bursts with a loud 'POP'.
No need to light a fuse -
fun for all ages.

Product Code: NV181

Our Price: $79.50 

Novelties - Ground

CAMPFIRE FLAMES

Case Quantity: 50 pieces
per box, 10 boxes per case
(500 pieces total).

Add some excitement to
your next campout or
bonfire with Campfire
Flames, an exciting new
campfire novelty! Simply
throw 1-3 packages onto
any wood burning fire and
watch as the flames
instantly change to red,
blue, green and purple!

Product Code: NV309

Our Price: $311.90 

Novelties - Ground
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CRACKLING BALLS

Case Quantity: 6 pieces per
pack, 12 packs per box, 16
boxes per case (1,152
pieces total).

Crackling Balls are a time-
honored fireworks
tradition. Just light the
fuse and watch the intense
crackling display.

Product Code: NV122

Our Price: $117.00 

Novelties - Ground

FLASHING SIGNAL
(CANNON)

Case Quantity: 6 pieces in
each small box, 240 boxes
per case (1,440 pieces
total). 

Just like a disco strobe
light! These spin on the
ground and produce a
bright silver flash.

Product Code: NV156

Our Price: $151.00 

Novelties - Ground

GASSY GORILLA

Case Quantity: 144 pieces
per case.

This cheeky monkey starts
with a snake effect and
ends with a crackling
display.

Product Code: NV103

Our Price: $127.50 

Novelties - Ground

JUMBO CRACKLING
BALL

Case Quantity: 3 pieces per
pack, 40 packs per case
(120 pieces).

People just cannot get
enough of this super-
intense novelty. Jumbo
crackling balls are a great
seller, and a great deal of
fun!

Product Code: NV108

Our Price: $115.40 

Novelties - Ground
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JUMBO CRACKLING
BALL

Case Quantity: 4 pieces per
pack, 18 packs per box, 8
boxes per case (576
pieces total).

People just can't get
enough of this super-
intense novelty. Jumbo
crackling balls are a great
seller, and a great deal of
fun!

Product Code: NV284

Our Price: $146.30 

Novelties - Ground

JUMBO GROUND
BLOOM CRACKLING

Case Quantity: 6 pieces per
pack, 12 packs per unit, 12
units per case (864 pieces
total).

A great ground bloom
flower, Jumbo Ground
Bloom Crackling spins
from red to green, back to
red, with a burst of crackle
at the end. 

Product Code: NV299

Our Price: $233.90 

Novelties - Ground

M1 ABRAMS

Case Quantity: 12 pieces
per pack, 24 pieces per
case (288 pieces total). 

Light the fuse and watch
as Mama lays an egg! Pop
the balloon and smoke
comes out.

Product Code: NV307

Our Price: $183.10 

Novelties - Ground

NAUGHTY DOG

Case Quantity: 144 pieces
per case.

A great novelty that is sure
to give your friends and
family a chuckle. This dog
misbehaves with a red
flare to black snake before
a crackle finale.

Product Code: NV102

Our Price: $126.10 

Novelties - Ground
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NORMANDY
LANDING CRAFT

Case Quantity: 54 pieces
per case. 

The lander whistles and
gives off white flashes
from the stern, then the
helicopter takes off. Blue
light and crackling white
come from the landers
stack, while red lights and
crackling come from the
artillery gun. The tank is
released and moves out
with a crackling white
display.

Product Code: NV293

Our Price: $341.10 

Novelties - Ground

PENGUIN MAMA

Case Quantity: 12 pieces
per pack, 24 pieces per
case (288 pieces total).

Light the fuse and watch
as Mama lays an egg! Pop
the balloon and smoke
comes out.

Product Code: NV305

Our Price: $155.70 

Novelties - Ground

PREMIUM GROUND
BLOOM FLOWER

Case Quantity: 6 pieces per
pack, 12 packs per box, 20
boxes per case (1440
pieces total).

Spins on a smooth surface
and produces a pretty red
and green flower. 20 packs
of 12 containing 6 pieces
each per case.

Product Code: NV133

Our Price: $172.70 

Novelties - Ground

SNAKES OUT OF
THE CAVE

Case Quantity: 12 pieces
per box, 12 boxes per case
(144 pieces total).

Light the fuse and watch
as the blue flame in the
center draws five snakes
out from the cave.

Product Code: NV132

Our Price: $109.30 

Novelties - Ground
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SPINNING FIREFLY

Case Quantity: 4 pieces per
pack, 72 packs per case
(288 pieces total). 

A great ground spinner
that goes above and
beyond with titanium
flower to red, green and
yellow spinner. Ends with
loud crackling.

Product Code: NV316

Our Price: $132.60 

Novelties - Ground

UNICORN CHASER

Case Quantity: 2 pieces per
pack, 60 packs per case
(120 total pieces).

Chase your dreams with
lively novelty! Glittering
drivers send this magical
marvel forwards in a
shower of sparks. A great
novelty for children's
birthday parties!

Product Code: NV154

Our Price: $125.20 

Novelties - Ground

WHISTLING CHASER

Case Quantity: 6 pieces per
pack, 24 packs per box, 10
boxes per case (1,440
pieces total).

A fireworks favorite,
Whistling Chaser makes a
loud noise as it spins on
the ground. 

Product Code: NV282

Our Price: $202.80 

Novelties - Ground

AIRBORNE
OPERATIONS - 19
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 8 pieces per
case. 

Watch this attack of
crackling and red flash
followed by parachutes
and whistling. Enjoy the
super 3-shot finale. This
parachute cake is anything
but ordinary!

Product Code: PC120

Our Price: $182.90 

Parachutes
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CAPTAIN AMERICA -
30 SHOTS

Case Quantity: 6 pieces per
case. 

Call on the Captain. He and
his 29 cohorts parachute
to earth carrying American
flags in trails of purple,
blue, yellow and green
smoke. Six shot finale. For
daytime use. 6 pieces per
case.

Product Code: PC121

Our Price: $226.60 

Parachutes

DAY PARACHUTE

Case Quantity: 6 pieces per
box, 48 boxes per case
(288 pieces total).


A classic day item, and a
must have for fireworks
retailers. Each tube
launches a parachute
about 30 feet in the air.

Product Code: PC100

Our Price: $168.80 

Parachutes

PARTY POPPER

Receive free shipping on
this item!

Case Quantity: 72 pieces
per pack, 20 packs per
case. 1440 total pieces.

A great piece that everyone
is familiar with - just pull
the string to shoot confetti.
A retail classic and a party
favorite!

Product Code: CF127

Our Price: $156.10 

Party Poppers

SMALL PUNKS - 10"
(100X100)

Receive free shipping on
this item!

Case Quantity: 100 punks
per pack, 100 packs per
case (10,000 pieces total).

A must have if you sell
fireworks. Classic 10"
punks.

Product Code: PK102

Our Price: $152.10 

Punks
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BACON BIT
BARRAGE - 140
SHOT

Case Quantity: 12 pieces
per case.

This monster candle blasts
bits of red, green, blue, and
silver with bacon-sizzling
crackle.

Product Code: RC101

Our Price: $138.20 

Roman Candles

BAMBOO BANGERS -
8 SHOTS

Case Quantity: 4 roman
candles per pack, 36 packs
per case (144 pieces total).

These popular roman
candles have 8 amazing
shots of red and blue stars
with reports.

Product Code: RC110

Our Price: $136.00 

Roman Candles

BLACKJACK - 5
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 4 pieces per
pack, 24 packs per case
(96 total pieces). 

Each pack has four
candles with different
effects. 1. Gold palm tails
and chrysanthemum. 2.
Silver palm tails and
chrysanthemum. 3. Silver
glittering willows and silver
glitter. 4. Lemon palm tails
and red pearls.

Product Code: RC224

Our Price: $166.40 

Roman Candles

CAMO SHOTS - 10
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 6 roman
candles per pack, 24 packs
per case (144 pieces total).

This 10-shot roman candle
is a great one that will not
disappoint. A new hot
seller from Mighty Max,
Camo Shots is
outstanding! Alternating
red and green pearls.

Product Code: RC194

Our Price: $118.60 

Roman Candles
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CRAZY ACES - 5
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 4 roman
candles per pack, 24 packs
per case (96 pieces total). 

Another outstanding 5
shot candle from Brothers.
These sticks have amazing
quality and variety! You will
see crackling, stars,
spinners, flying fish,
whistles, and colored tails.

Product Code: RC108

Our Price: $193.60 

Roman Candles

FIRING SQUAD - 210
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 12 roman
candles per case. 

Our biggest barrage. Get a
staggering 210 shots of
red, green, and white stars
with crackling tail.

Duration: 60 sec.

Product Code: RC230

Our Price: $138.20 

Roman Candles

MAGICAL SHOOTER
(ROMAN CANDLE) -
10 SHOT

Case Quantity: 12 roman
candles per pack, 80 packs
per case (960 pieces total).

A high quality, inexpensive
candle that's a mini of the
classic 10 ball.

Product Code: RC200

Our Price: $191.10 

Roman Candles

ROMAN CANDLE W/
BANG - 10 SHOT

Case Quantity: 4 roman
candles per pack, 36 packs
per case (144 pieces total).

Classic roman candle with
a high gloss label!

Product Code: RC115

Our Price: $112.30 

Roman Candles
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25-SHOT SATURN
MISSILE (CANNON)

Case Quantity: 120 pieces
per case.

A small piece that makes a
great bargain .

Product Code: SM146

Our Price: $161.10 

Saturn Missiles

300-SHOT SATURN
MISSILE BATTERY

Case Quantity: 12 pieces
per case. 

300-shots!! This is our top
selling saturn missile
battery. Two stages,
whistling missiles with
loud report to whistling
missile with crackling
effect, which builds to
finale of 2 twenty-five shot
bursts with whistling
missiles with crackling
effect. Lasts approximately
2 1/2 minutes.

Product Code: SM124

Our Price: $163.10 

Saturn Missiles

FLAG MISSILE
BATTERY - 200
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 15 pieces
per case.

This is the perfect saturn
missile battery. Not too
big, not too small, with
varied effects. Red, silver
and green stars, whistling
golden and silver tails to
crackling and report lead
to a quickened finale.

Product Code: SM128

Our Price: $190.30 

Saturn Missiles

JUMBO COLOR
SATURN MISSILE
BATTERY - 180
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 3 pieces per
case. 

Just when you thought you
had seen it all, Shogun
does it again- 60 shots of
whistle and red tail to
crackling, 60 shots of
whistle and green tail to
reports, and 60 shots of
silver titanium tail to
reports all in a JUMBO size
missile battery. How cool
is that?!!

Product Code: SM132

Our Price: $182.70 

Saturn Missiles
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JUMBO SATURN
MISSILES - 104
SHOTS

Case Quantity: 12 pieces
per case. 

A great saturn missile
battery that combines the
effects of the Giant Saturn
Missile Battery (SM121)
and the Tri-light Missile
Battery (SM103).

Product Code: SM104

Our Price: $169.10 

Saturn Missiles

SATURN MISSILE
BATTERY - 100
SHOT

A great size for a saturn
missile battery. Watch 100
rockets screaming through
the atmosphere.

Product Code: SM151

Our Price: $142.30 

Saturn Missiles

SATURN MISSILE
BATTERY - 25 SHOT

A small piece that makes a
great bargain at your
location. Place by the cash
register for last-minute
impulse sales.

Product Code: SM150

Our Price: $153.80 

Saturn Missiles

COLOR MAMMOTH
SMOKE

Case Quantity: 4 pieces per
pack, 36 packs per case
(144 piece case).

Vibrant, colorful smoke
that billows for over 40
seconds. Great modern
packaging from Sky
Bacon.

Product Code: SK113

Our Price: $169.40 

Smoke
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COLOR SMOKE
BALLS (CLAY)

Receive free shipping on
this item!

6 assorted color smoke
balls per pack. A classic
fireworks piece that makes
a great daytime or
nighttime item.

Product Code: SK105

Our Price: $149.90 

Smoke

COLOR SMOKE
GRENADES

Case Quantity: 24 pieces
per box, 6 boxes per case
(144 piece case).

Our great pull-string smoke
grenades now come in red,
white, blue, green, yellow,
and purple.

Product Code: SK134

Our Price: $270.50 

Smoke

FIVE MINUTE
SMOKE

Case Quantity: 100 pieces
per case.

Why settle for a short-term
fix? Get FIVE minutes of
smoke in each stick. Great
for daytime use, or
nighttime use with strobes
or fountains. 

Product Code: SK106

Our Price: $141.70 

Smoke

JOHNNY BS PYRO
SET

Case Quantity: 8
assortments.
One of our best values for
a tray assortment. This set
is packed with lots of
goodies to keep your
family lighting fuses all
night! Including
firecrackers, saturn
missiles, fountains,
sparklers and novelties.

Product Code: AT142

Our Price: $203.20 

Smoke
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MAMMOTH WHITE
SMOKE (120 SEC)

Case Quantity: 6 pieces per
pack, 24 packs case (144
pieces total).

These sticks puff out white
plumes of smoke for 120
seconds! Great for daytime
or nighttime use.

Product Code: SK101

Our Price: $123.90 

Smoke

NEON SMOKE
BALLS

Receive free shipping on
this item!

Case Quantity: 6 pieces per
pack, 12 packs per box, 20
boxes per case (1440
piece case).

Product Code: SK103

Our Price: $218.50 

Smoke

PINK SMOKE

Case Quantity: 100 pieces
per case.

High-quality, voluminous
smoke from Sky Bacon.
Each stick pumps out 45
seconds of pink.

Product Code: SK107

Our Price: $130.30 

Smoke

SUPER JUMBO
SMOKE BALLS

Case Quantity: 12 pieces
per pack, 2 packs per case
(24 total pieces).

These balls are giant!
Softball-sized smoke
bombs you have to see to
believe! Each box comes
with three of each of green,
blue, red and pink. 

Duration: 60 sec.

Product Code: SK144

Our Price: $132.00 

Smoke
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WORLDS LARGEST
SMOKE BALL

Case Quantity: 12 pieces
per pack, 2 packs per case
(24 total pieces).

These balls are giant!
Softball-sized smoke
bombs you have to see to
believe! Each box comes
with three of each of green,
blue, red and pink. 

Duration: 60 sec.

Product Code: SK143

Our Price: $106.20 

Smoke

BANG SNAP

Receive free shipping on
this item!

Case Quantity: 50 snaps
per small box, 50 small
boxes per large box, 6
large boxes per case
(15,000 pieces total).

These classic snappers
come in great updated
packaging. Kids love the
design of the box and the
performance of this
classic favorite.

Product Code: SN109

Our Price: $113.20 

Snappers

#14 MORNING
GLORY

Receive free shipping on
this item!

Case Quantity: 6 sparklers
per bundle, 24 bundles per
box, 15 boxes per case.
(2,160 pieces total).

A very popular and
inexpensive item, this
multi-stage sparkler burns
three different colors with
crackling effects. 6
sparklers per bundle, 24
bundles per box, 15 boxes
per case.

Product Code: SP172

Our Price: $134.80 

Sparklers

#20 PREMIUM GOLD
WEDDING
SPARKLES (WIRE)

Receive free shipping on
this item!

Case Quantity: 8 sparklers
per box, 12 packs per pack,
8 packs per case (768
pieces total).

Our most popular sparkler
for weddings has been
improved with an
additional 45 seconds of
burn time and tighter
packaging for better
shipping. Place a pack at
each table, hand them out
to guests... Read More

Product Code: SP167C

Our Price: $171.40 

Sparklers
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36" GOLD WEDDING
SPARKLERS WIRE
(NO BRANDING)

Receive free shipping on
this item!

Case Quantity: 8 sparklers
per pack, 6 packs per box,
4 boxes per case (192
pieces total).

Super long 36" sparklers
with handles made from
sturdy wire for increased
safety. In an elegant
wedding themed box.
Everyone wants sparklers!

Product Code: SP168C

Our Price: $131.10 

Sparklers

36" MORNING
GLORY

Receive free shipping on
this item!

Case Quantity: 6 sparklers
per bundle, 96 bundles per
case (576 pieces total).

A fireworks show you can
hold in your hand! Watch
these sparklers give off red
flares, silver crackling
effects, and green flares.
Lasts for 2 1/2 minutes.

Product Code: SP174

Our Price: $161.00 

Sparklers

NEON SPARKLERS

Receive free shipping on
this item!

Case Quantity: 5 sparklers
per pack, 100 packs per
case (500 pieces total).

A staple safe-and-sane
item reimagined for the
21st century. Bright neon
colors help this item fly off
the shelf.

Product Code: SP121

Our Price: $141.30 

Sparklers

CLUSTERING BEE
(MIGHTY MAX)

Case Quantity: 6 rockets
per pack, 72 packs per
case (432 pieces total).

A classic stick rocket from
Mighty Max. Flies high with
a loud stinger report.

Product Code: SR132

Our Price: $123.30 

Stick Rockets
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CORONA ROCKETS
(24/6)

Case Quantity: 6 rockets
per pack, 24 packs per
case (144 pieces total) . 

Top quality rockets from
Brothers. Amazing height
and great effects. Contains
the following: 1) blue
crackling with red stars 2)
lemon stars 3) purple to
green glitter with crackling
4) pink stars 5) yellow
palm with green glitter 6)
sunflower to ... Read More

Product Code: SR136A

Our Price: $192.00 

Stick Rockets

GIANT TEXAS POP
ROCKET

Case Quantity: 6 rockets
per pack, 36 packs per
case (216 pieces total). 

Large sized classic Texas
pop rockets with a big
bushy tail of sparks and a
loud break with a single
star heading.

Product Code: SR224

Our Price: $179.50 

Stick Rockets

MAXIMUM
ALTITUDE

Case Quantity: 4 rockets
per pack, 12 packs per
case (48 pieces total).

Super height from these
rockets leads to bursts of
red and green crackling
willow, purple willow,
purple and green stars to
crackling, and blue
crackling willow.

Product Code: SR122

Our Price: $163.20 

Stick Rockets

RDS - ROCKET
DEFENSE SYSTEM

Case Quantity: 21 rockets
per pack, 4 packs per case
(84 pieces total).

A full-on aerial assault of
stick rockets with assorted
effects. An impressive
package with a wide
variety of hard-hitting
breaks.

Product Code: SR101

Our Price: $148.40 

Stick Rockets
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SCREAMING
CRACKLERS

Case Quantity: 12 rockets
per pack, 72 packs per
case (864 pieces total). 

Super loud whistling rocket
that fires about 100 feet
and then explodes into a
silver crackling barrage. A
great value!

Product Code: SR111

Our Price: $319.50 

Stick Rockets

SKYBOLT

Case Quantity: 5 rockets
per pack, 24 packs per
case (120 pieces total). 

These rockets light the sky
with multicolored palms,
double rings, red ring with
silver pistil, green ring with
crackling, and gold palm
with crackling.

Product Code: SR216

Our Price: $252.40 

Stick Rockets

SNIPER ROCKET

Case Quantity: 12 rockets
per pack, 72 packs per
case (864 pieces total).

This high flier lets out a
super loud whistle and
then explodes with 3 loud
reports. A best seller!

Product Code: SR112

Our Price: $282.50 

Stick Rockets

TEXAS POP ROCKET

Case Quantity: 6 rockets
per pack, 96 packs per
case (576 pieces total).

These Texas-sized stick
rockets fly high, fly fast,
and burst with a loud
report at the apex of their
flight. Classic stick rocket
performance, with up-to-
date technology.

Product Code: SR201

Our Price: $230.80 

Stick Rockets
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TRIPLE BANG
ROCKET (72/12)

Case Quantity: 12 rockets
per pack, 72 packs per
case (864 pieces total).

A whistling stick rocket
that ends in a trio of
reports.

Product Code: SR200A

Our Price: $324.20 

Stick Rockets

WILD GEESE
ROCKET

Case Quantity: 6 rockets
per pack, 48 packs per
case (288 pieces total).

A great value stick rocket
from Mighty Max. A high
flyer with a great effect.

Product Code: SR139

Our Price: $127.30 

Stick Rockets
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